
BLT project- Spring 1 
Due Monday 8th February

Maths- Practise and ensure you 
are confident in your 2, 5 and 
10 time tables. 

A great way to build up your 
speed it to play Hit the button.  

ww.topmarks.co.uk/hitthebutton

Writing- Can you write an 
non-chronological report 
about Boundary Primary 
School? 

Think about how what 
important information you 
can think of about the 
school. Remember to include 
subheadings. 

Science -In Science we are 
learning animals and their 
habitats.   

Can you create your a model 
habitat? Think about which 
animal you want to choose 
and where that animal would 
live. We look forward to 
seeing them. 

Computing- Create you own 
poster to advertise online 
safety. Remind people how 
to stay safe online and 
what to do if you have 
concerns.  

Don’t forget to 
READ, READ, 

READ!

Don’t forget to 
keep practising 

the Year 2 
spellings. 

http://ww.topmarks.co.uk/hitthebutton
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